COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

BID NO: RFQ 24/15
SUBJECT: Russell Misc. Classroom Furniture
DATE: 5/22/2023
| SCHOOL/DEPT: Russell Elementary
[AWARDED TO: SSI Furnishings & Fre3dom Interiors (see highlighed items)
SSI Furnishings Office Essentials Indoff, Inc. MO Vocational Enterprises ‘School Specialty School Outfitters Unites Supply Corp Learnin; 1 Midwest Technology Prodeuts Fre3dom Interiors. Lakeshore Equipmnet Company
Pleasant Valley. MO ‘Columbia, M 1 Louis. M Jefferson City. MO Greenville, W1 ‘Cincinnati, O rvingion, NJ Houston, TX fou City. IA Kansas City. MO Carson, CA
it it
Brand Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand | Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand ::: Ext. Price Brand Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand Ext. Price Brand Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand Unit Price | Ext. Price Brand :" * Ext. Price
Oty rice
tion A (tablesdesis) Total
Item 1 Activity Tables 48" Round] 2: Artcobell $212.14 $4.879.22 $0.00 ScholCraft $5.140.50 MVE $220. 5,060, Classroom Select| $218.25 5,019.75 See quote 5,150.85 FDP 204.18 $4,696.14 Alumni $176.85 $4,067.55 Wiscosin Bench $292.64 6,730.72 | Lakeshore | $331.5: 7,625.6:
ltem 1 Activity Tables 24"x48" rectangle] 12 S181.84 $2.182.08 $0.00 $1.847.88 S173. 52,076, $15743 | $1.889.16 2,349.84 146.85 $147.72 $1.772.64 $173.18 2,078.16 $246.0:
Item | Activity Tables 42" Squarc] 9 $203.48 1.831.32 $0.00 $2.002.50 $486. $4,374. 187.27 1,685.43 1,701.27 193.73 $164.37 $1,479.33 $216.82 | $1951.38 $236.5
e 1 Activity Tables 36x72" rectangle| 6 susiz | s142872 50.00 $1.799.94 $532 3,192 24783 | S1.486.98 161724 22306 524553 | s1473.18 $280.09 | S1.680.54 53315
Ttem 1 Activity Tables 48" Kidney] 5 $311.72 1.558.60 $0.00 $1,575.00 $432. 2,160. 294,32 1,471.60 1,590.20 273 .48 $322.52 $1,612.60 $387.27 1,936. $417.0:
ltem 2 Student Desk] 94 $125.55 | $11.801.70 $0.00 $9.141.50 $197. S18,518. 116.71 $10,970.74 9,106.72 $111.01 | $10.434.94 $207.00 19.458.00 $464.5°
Item 3 Mobile Teacher Desk] 9 $710.00 $6.390.00 $0.00 $8.041.50 $1,183.00] $10,647. 738.18 $6,643.62 $1,026.34 | $9.237.06 $972.52 $1,139.05
Item 3 Mobile Teacher Lectern] 6 $568.24 $3.409.44 $0.00 $3.660.00 No Bid WB $537.18 $3,22: $456.80 $2.740.80 $381.82 No BID
Install $0.00 $605.00 $7.842.00 $6.919.89 9,849.16. Included
Total $33.481.08 NO BID $33.813.82 Did not Bid All Options $40,232.36 $51,731.02 $39,442.14 $39.737.99 NO BID $54,727.91 Did not Bid all Items
Scction B (chairs)
Item 5 Classroom Chairs 14"] 130 | Arteobell $41.13 $5.346.90 Marco $63.75 $8,287.50 $41.25 $5.362.50 MVE 74, $9,620.00_| Classroom Select| 38.32 $4,981.60 4838 $6,289.40 FDP 34.29 $4,457.70 Alumni $41.39 $5.380.70 Acedemia 51.72 $6,723.60 | Lakeshore 64.59 $8,396.70
ltem 5 Cls Chairs 16°] 440 $49.79 $21.907.60 $66.75 | $29.370.00 $45.49 | $20.015.60) 79. $34,760.00 43.51 $19,144.40 67.78 $29.823.20 36.94 $16,253.60 $43.79 $19.267.60 $57.27 $25,198.80 78.84 $34,689.60
tem s Classroom Chair 157] 306 54979 | 51523574 56675 | $20.425.50 §5049_| 51544994 52,00 | 525,092.00 5051 | 51545912 6778 547.96_| 514.675.16 54395 | 51344870 5827 | $17.830.62 93.09
em 6 Ct swoots 187 30 si7.44_| 142320 ss2600 | 8157800 $3955 | 5118650 79.00 | $2370.00 4584 | $137520 51.29 54133 | $1329.90 Si6.47 | $1.394.10 4138 | s12a140 12255 | $3.67650
TncTudes Section AB | N
] T 16000 S050000 o $2,000.00 $8,606.00 $13.638.00 920930 $21.518.66 $0.00
Section B (C G Total $43.913.44 $61,821.00] $46,514.54) $73,842.00 $49.566.32 $72,029.98 $36,716.96 $48.700.40 NO BID $72,513.08 $75,248.34
Section C (Award by Ttem)
. . W orali CS " . o1 " i Py 496, fsconsin Ben: 66 i Shor
rem?ipep e 10 [ I e | s | sr2e000 s62000 | s620000 | BN ES T ga77 | ssa67.70 sioass | ssoasso [ we | siases | sinaseao [ 0| Gor | gonn e [WisconsinBend] 5662 | s7.96620 W8 $32264 | $322640 [ Lakeshore [ $930.05 | $9.300.50
Item 7w Install] | $0.00 $4.545.90 $360.00 | $7.620.00 56,2 $1,780.00 [ $10,247.70 $0.00 0.00 $12,496.40 $918.21 $4.915.31 $1,194.93 $9,161.13 $1,496.61 4,723.01 $0.00 $9.300.50
Item 8 Book Cases| 34 Global $160.02 $5.440.68 Hon $165.00 ,610.00 Global $153.75 $282.00 9.5¢ Global $190.49 $6,476.66 $187.09 $6.361.06 HON $276.93 $9.415.62 Hon_ $161.07 $5.476.38 Global $324.75 $11,041.50) Hon ,338.00_| Lakeshore | $502.55 $17,086.70
Tiem § w Intall| 1 5000 | $5.440.68 536000_| $5,970.00 $680.00 9,51 $1,405.00 | $7.881.66 50.00 0.00 | 941562 $1.366.29 |_S6,842.67 $1,656.23 | 512,607.73 [ 5672122 5000 |_S17,086.70
liem 9 Teacher Chairs| 11 Global $282.96 $3.112.56 Hon $284.00 | $3.124.00 Hon_ $225.80 | $2.483.80 $319.00 3.5 Hon. $272.65 $2,999.15 $145.38 $1,599.18 Alera $249.58 $2,745.38 $226.03 $2,486.33 HON $348.58 $3.834.38 Hon | $242341 No Bid
Grand Total $103,592.80) $111,557.19 $145,309.52] $100,816.50] $115,262.80] $141,389.63 ]




	web

